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With her unique blend of courtroom drama and feverish suspense, critically acclaimed author Jonnie Jacobs
has won a legion of fans for her Kali O’Brien thrillers. Now the edgy San Francisco attorney is back to
handle a simple adoption – and winds up defending her client for murder . . .

Straightforward and short term: that’s precisely the kind of case Kali O’Brien needs at the moment. Yet the
Harper adoption makes her uneasy from the start. Maybe it’s because psychologist Steven Cross – a man
whose path hasn’t crossed hers since the tragedy that shattered his life and their forbidden relationship years
ago – unexpectedly referred the couple to her. Or could it be that Ted and Terri Harper’s previous brush with
parenthood ended in heartache when the birth mother changed her mind?

This time around, the former star quarterback and his lovely blonde wife aren’t taking any chances. They’ve
even moved pregnant Melissa Burke into their lavish Pacific Heights home. As Kali watches her determined
clients shower the lonesome teenager with love and attention, she can’t help wondering just how desperate
they are to claim the unborn child. When Melissa delivers a health6 baby girl and promptly signs the final
adoption papers, Kali breathes a sigh of relief . . . until Bram Weaver surfaces.

The controversial, chauvinistic radio talk show host announces he’s the baby’s father – a claim Melissa can’t
dispute. With a sinking heart, Kali prepares to defend the Harpers in a bitter custody battle that’s certain to
end in the birth father’s favor – until the case takes a shocking turn when somebody murders Weaver.
Despite Terri Harper’s staunch denial, the police have compelling evidence linking her to the crime, leaving
Kali to wonder how far an emotion-fraught new mother will go to protect her child.

Once again, Jonnie Jacobs delivers an explosive, fast-paced thriller infused with authenticity and well-drawn
characters. Witness for the Defense is a razor-sharp ride through the ethical dilemmas ripped from today’s
headlines.
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From reader reviews:

Deborah Tate:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or info even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move forward. Some of
you maybe will update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice in your case but the
problems coming to a person is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Witness for the
Defense (Kali O'Brien series Book 4) is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, as
this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Lidia Flynn:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Textbooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their particular reader with their
story or maybe their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about the data
about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young
ones, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors these days always try to improve their skill in
writing, they also doing some study before they write to the book. One of them is this Witness for the
Defense (Kali O'Brien series Book 4).

Bernetta Smith:

Don't be worry when you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book way, more simple and reachable. This particular Witness for the Defense (Kali O'Brien series Book 4)
can give you a lot of pals because by you looking at this one book you have factor that they don't and make
an individual more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of a step for you to get success.
This guide offer you information that probably your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than
various other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? We should have Witness for the Defense (Kali
O'Brien series Book 4).

Melvin Smith:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
a book. Book is written or printed or highlighted from each source that will filled update of news. Within this
modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media social just
like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just seeking the
Witness for the Defense (Kali O'Brien series Book 4) when you required it?
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